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August 20, 2009 AGENDA ITEM Item 18

[ ] Ordinance [ ] Resolution [ ] Budget Resolution [ X ] Other

Department: Financial and Administrative Services  File Number: VC-1249067405321-A
Division: Purchasing

Subject: Cancellation of lawn maintenance contract and award to alternate lawn
maintenance contractors.

Account Number(s): Various accounts County-wide for $395,000.00
Total Item Budget: $395,000.00
Staff Contact(s): Jeanine Jennings Phone: 822-5789 ext. 5789

Summary/Highlights:

On May 21, 2009, county council awarded lawn maintenance for Zones 1-4 to Helping
Hand Lawn Care, Sorrento, Florida. On July 29, 2009, Helping Hand notified the county
that they are going out of business. Using departments met to review the next lowest
responsible vendors. Staff recommends that council cancel the agreement with Helping
Hand lawn care and award to the next low responsive and responsible bidder in each
zone as follows: Central Florida Bobcat, DeLand, Florida, zones 1 and 4; Midstate
Lawnscape, Enterprise, Florida, zone 2, and JEM Enterprises, Deltona, Florida, zone 3.
Price agreements will be issued for three years with two one year renewal options.

Recommended Motion:
Approval.
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COUNTY OF VOLUSIA, FL
AWARD RECOMMENDATION

ALL BIDS ACCEPTED BY THE COUNTY OF VOLUSIA ARE SUBJECT TO THE
COUNTY'S TERMS AND CONDITIONS. ANY AND ALL ADDITIONAL TERMS AND
CONDITIONS SUBMITTED BY THE BIDDERS ARE REJECTED AND SHALL HAVE
NO FORCE AND EFFECT. BID DOCUMENTS FROM THE VENDORS LISTED
HEREIN ARE THE ONLY BIDS RECEIVED TIMELY AS OF THE OPENING DATE ANL
TIME. ALL OTHER BID DOCUMENTS SUBMITTED IN RESPONSE TO THIS
SOLICITATION, IF ANY, ARE HEREBY REJECTED AS LATE.

BID NUMBER: 09-B-17KW
BID TITLE: Lawn and Grounds Maintenance

OPENING DATE/TIME: February 11, 2009 3:00 p.m.

VVendor Zone 1 Zone 2 Zone 3 Zone 4 Zone 5 Zone 6
ABC Express Lawn Care Inc., DeBary,
Florida $37,589.00 $220,057.00 $77,857.00 $179,008.00 $81,424.00 No Bid
C & C Construction Consultants, Inc., New
Smyrna Beach, Florida No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $43,461.00
CCR Total Turf, DeLand, Florida No Bid No Bid No Bid $190,542.00 No Bid No Bid
Central Florida Bobcat, DeLand, Florida $34,170.00 $148,859.00 $63,261.00 $171,452.00 $94,636.00 No Bid
DTE Landscape, Inc., Deltona, Florida $37,779.70 $195,226.35 $82,972.94 $175,395.33 $67,078.20 $43,873.00
Environmental Innovations, Inc., Orange
Park, Florida $39,510.00 No Bid $71,365.00 $198,829.00 $103,488.00 No Bid
Gales W. Cone Il Inc., Port Orange, Florida $34,500.72 $154,953.67 $60,298.19 No Bid $90,778.77 No Bid
Glencoe Lawns Inc., New Smyrna Beach,
Florida No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32,925.00
Helping Hand Lawn Care, Inc., Sorrento,
Florida $26,191.00 $118,098.00 $55,967.00 $140,265.00 $59,185.00 $58,190.00
JEM Enterprises of Central Florida, Deltona,
Florida $34,889.00 $175,494.00 $57,985.00 $181,404.00 $56,815.00 $67,788.00
McQueen's Complete Lawns Service,
Deltona, Florida No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $93,800.59 No Bid
"Midstate Lawnscape, Enterprise, Florida No Bid $130,910.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Robinson Tractor Service, Inc., DeLeon
Springs, Florida No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $40,827.00
Sam's Bushhog Mowing, DelLand, Florida No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $44,119.50
Servello & Son, DeBary, Florida* $32,059.66 $124,730.39 $65,647.26 $186,145.70 $97,434.14 $41,277.00
Sunworks Lawn Service, DeLand, Florida $36,390.00 No Bid No Bid $190,715.00 No Bid No Bid
TSM Enterprises, DeLeon Springs, Florida No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $36,066.00
Tuff Turf, New Smyrna Beach, Florida $34,382.53 $134,305.00 $68,343.00 $241,710.00 $79,680.00 $30,120.00
U.S. Lawns, Palm Coast, Florida $37,339.50 $153,790.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Opened and Tabulated by Kathy Williams and Pam Wilsky, Procurement Analysts

*Servello deemed non responsible

Award Recommendation: Zone 1 and 4 - Central Florida Bobcat, Zone 2 - Midstate Lawnscape, Zone 3 - JEM Enterprises

Council Date: August 20, 2009




